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Extending the visionary early work of the late Marshall McLuhan, The Global Village, one of his last
collaborative efforts, applies that vision to today's worldwide, integrated electronic network.
When McLuhan's groundbreaking Understanding Media was published in 1964, the media as we know it
today did not exist. But McLuhan's argument, that the technological extensions of human consciousness
were racing ahead of our ability to understand their consequences, has never been more compelling. And if
the medium is the message, as McLuhan maintained, then the message is becoming almost impossible to
decipher.
In The Global Village, McLuhan and co-author Bruce R. Powers propose a detailed conceptual framework in
terms of which the technological advances of the past two decades may be understood. At the heart of their
theory is the argument that today's users of technology are caught between two very different ways of
perceiving the world. On the one hand there is what they refer to as Visual Space--the linear, quantitative
mode of perception that is characteristic of the Western world; on the other hand there is Acoustic Space--the
holistic, qualitative reasoning of the East. The medium of print, the authors argue, fosters and preserves the
perception of Visual Space; but, like television, the technologies of the data base, the communications
satellite, and the global media network are pushing their users towards the more dynamic, "many-centered"
orientation of Acoustic Space.
The authors warn, however, that this movement towards Acoustic Space may not go smoothly. Indeed,
McLuhan and Powers argue that with the advent of the global village--the result of worldwide
communications--these two worldviews "are slamming into each other at the speed of light," asserting that
"the key to peace is to understand both these systems simultaneously."
Employing McLuhan's concept of the Tetrad--a device for predicting the changes wrought by new
technologies--the authors analyze this collision of viewpoints. Taking no sides, they seek to do today what
McLuhan did so successfully twenty-five years ago--to look around the corner of the coming world, and to
help us all be prepared for what we will find there.
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From reader reviews:

Walter Cornwell:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a stroll,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed The Global Village:
Transformations in World Life and Media in the 21st Century? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
already know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you
agree with it has the opinion or you have other opinion?

Nathan Hutchison:

The reason? Because this The Global Village: Transformations in World Life and Media in the 21st Century
is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with
the secret this inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
wonderful way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning fully. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your ability and
your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go to the
reserve store hurriedly.

Heather Lanham:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not trying The Global Village:
Transformations in World Life and Media in the 21st Century that give your entertainment preference will be
satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the opportunity for
people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be mentioned constantly
that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for
every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you may pick The Global Village:
Transformations in World Life and Media in the 21st Century become your current starter.

Elizabeth Villalobos:

You may spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This The Global Village: Transformations in
World Life and Media in the 21st Century is simple to develop you can read it in the park your car, in the
beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-
book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Therefore there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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