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Note: This novella is the second installment in the Peri Jean Mace series. The print version is approximately
180 pages. Please be aware before purchasing that this is a short novel. I’m Peri Jean Mace, and I see ghosts.
Between the ghosts and my own dumb choices, my life is a puke-inducing screamer of a roller coaster ride.
My latest dumb choice catapults me all the way from East Texas to South Louisiana. So far, it’s been a trip
to the bad crap zone. My boyfriend and I got into a fight because he’s a lying jerk. A ghost trashed my car
because she wants her murder solved. The boyfriend’s ex-wife—who’s still sniffing around—loves the
drama because she’s a…never mind. I’d love nothing more than to take the next bus back to Texas. But this
teenage ghost is my boyfriend’s sister who went missing twenty years ago. Her family needs to know what
happened. Now I’m stuck in this huge house with people I didn’t even know existed twenty-four hours ago.
They’re nice enough, but talk about awkward. This family’s secrets could be the basis of a tell-all tabloid
soap opera. Trying to solve this murder might be another one of my dumb choices. There’s more suspects
than ants on ice cream. The killer has gotten away with this for twenty years, and it seems like any clues
would be long lost. But every conversation reveals another secret. Little bits and pieces lock together as I
close in on a horrifying truth. How far will a murderer go to protect a secret? My guess is pretty durn far.
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From reader reviews:

James Miguel:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic in the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of
charge time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the e-book untitled Black Opal (Peri Jean Mace Paranormal Mysteries)
(Volume 2) can be very good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Mary West:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find publication that
need more time to be go through. Black Opal (Peri Jean Mace Paranormal Mysteries) (Volume 2) can be
your answer as it can be read by you who have those short free time problems.

Sabrina King:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Black Opal (Peri Jean Mace
Paranormal Mysteries) (Volume 2) is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train along with soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy
often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. And so
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Kimberly Smith:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And you know
that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims Black Opal (Peri Jean
Mace Paranormal Mysteries) (Volume 2).
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