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ENDURING LITERATURE ILLUMINATED BY PRACTICAL SCHOLARSHIP

In this extraordinarily rich and complex novel, Anna Karenina defies the conventions of nineteenth-century
Russian society and embarks on a love affair that has tragic consequences. Tolstoy’s work is a powerful
meditation on love and marriage, envy and retribution, and the desire for happiness.

THIS ENRICHED CLASSIC EDITION INCLUDES:

• A concise introduction that gives the reader important background information

 

• A chronology of the author’s life and work

• A timeline of significant events that provides the book’s historical context

• An outline of key themes and plot points to guide the reader’s own interpretations

 

• Detailed explanatory notes

• Critical analysis and modern perspectives on the work

• Discussion questions to promote lively classroom and book group interaction

• A list of recommended related books and films to broaden the reader’s experience

Simon & Schuster Enriched Classics offer readers affordable editions of great works of literature enhanced
by helpful notes and insightful commentary. The scholarship provided in Enriched Classics enables readers
to appreciate, understand, and enjoy the world’s finest books to their full potential.
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From reader reviews:

James Bardsley:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible Anna Karenina
(Enriched Classics)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time
along with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have
other opinion?

Matthew Wallace:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer
that question mainly because just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Anna Karenina
(Enriched Classics) to read.

Ida Shrout:

This Anna Karenina (Enriched Classics) is great e-book for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who have always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. That book
reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are
read that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but challenging core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Anna Karenina
(Enriched Classics) in your hand like having the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous just
one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?

Edward McCain:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
query was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to
understand that reading is very important as well as book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to
incorporate you knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning
something by book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these
claims Anna Karenina (Enriched Classics).
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