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When Copernicus, Galileo, and Kepler -- all deeply religious -- dislodged the earth from the center of the
universe, science and religion separated. Darwin's theory of evolution brought outright divorce. But now, as
Pruett writes, a third scientific revolution promises the reconciliation of reason and intuition by bringing a
new dimension of spirituality to our scientific understanding of the cosmos -- and to the unique place of
humans in it.

Reason and Wonder embraces the insights of modern science and the wisdom of spiritual traditions to "re-
enchant the universe" and to provide a new "myth of meaning" appropriate to the current era. The new myth,
which unfolds through the stories of three successive "Copernican revolutions" -- cosmological, biological,
and spiritual -- offers both an expansive view of human potential and hope for a future currently in grave
jeopardy.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Preuss:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for people. The book Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and
Spirit has been making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It
is rather advantages for you. The publication Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and
Spirit is not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when you really feel
bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship with
all the book Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and Spirit. You never really feel lose
out for everything in the event you read some books.

Treva Ritter:

This Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and Spirit are usually reliable for you who
want to be considered a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Reason and Wonder: A
Copernican Revolution in Science and Spirit can be among the great books you must have is definitely
giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you actually with information that perhaps will
shock your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your
conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Reason and Wonder: A Copernican
Revolution in Science and Spirit forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Katherine Khan:

The reason? Because this Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and Spirit is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with
the secret the item inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book get such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking way. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I had been you I
will go to the book store hurriedly.

Wanda Collins:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer can be Reason and Wonder: A Copernican Revolution in Science and Spirit



why because the wonderful cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly assist you to pick up this book.
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