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Have you or someone you know been a victim of bullying?

The Devastating Effects Of Bullying

Childhood bullying is on the rise, according to some studies, but can it actually cause death? According to
the CDC, suicide accounts for 4,400 deaths per year in young people. This, of course, doesn’t take the
number of missed suicide attempts into consideration. A Yale University study found that those who are
being bullied are estimated to be between 2-9 times more likely to contemplate suicide than those who aren’t
being bullied. ABC News reported that every day 160,000 kids stay home from school due to fear of
bullying.

Many high-profile bullying cases have garnered attention to the link between bullying and suicide across the
globe in recent years. While, in the past, bullying could easily be brushed off as “kids being kids” or just a
part of growing up, it can no longer be ignored. From children being bullied for their sexuality to the types of
toys they play with, it’s becoming a very real problem that can’t always be brushed off by ignoring the
tormentor.

The New Age Of Bullying

Social networking sites and texting have been blamed for the recent rise in bullying, especially since these
add a level of anonymity not felt or seen in the past. Pictures, messages, and posts can spread like wildfire
and what goes on online can infiltrate the classroom and the “real world.”

In the following book, we’ll go over some of the most recent child suicide cases instigated by bullying.
While most cases are those who were teenagers at the time of their deaths, some have been as young as 11-
and 12-years-old. By learning what to look for in a victim and gaining awareness of early warning signs, it
might be possible to prevent the tragedy before it happens. And with more awareness and education on the
parts of teachers, parents, and other adults involved in the child’s life, bullying could even be curtailed in the
future.

Time For Change

After reading these stories, hopefully it will shed some more light on how serious bullying is and you will
feel inspired to join others and take a stand against it.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Bruns:

This Bullycide Box Set: True Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide are reliable
for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this Bullycide Box Set:
True Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide can be on the list of great books you
must have is actually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with
information that possibly will shock your prior knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it
almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Bullycide
Box Set: True Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide giving you an enormous of
experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we all know it useful in
your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Linda Young:

The book untitled Bullycide Box Set: True Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide
is the e-book that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that
will be shown to anyone. The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is
easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the information that
they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Bullycide Box Set: True
Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide from the publisher to make you more enjoy
free time.

Nancy Royals:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Bullycide Box Set: True Stories
Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide, you could enjoy both. It is good combination right,
you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't
obtain it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Cheryl Crockett:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Bullycide Box Set: True Stories Exposing The
Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide was colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that
book Bullycide Box Set: True Stories Exposing The Influence Bullying Has On Youth Suicide has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can
read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it
can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like



reading this.
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