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Marian Engel was a writer's writer – an iconoclast, deeply admired and loved by a generation of Canadian
authors and critics. Informal gatherings were often held at Engel's Toronto house, and it was there that
Engel's many literary friendships were first nurtured, later to blossom through the exchange of numerous and
extraordinary letters, which are variously funny, insightful, irreverent, and moving. Engel's lively epistolary
practice offers a view of the literary landscape in Canada from 1965 to 1985 as seen through her
correspondence with mentor Hugh MacLennan, and friends and colleagues Robertson Davies, Dennis Lee,
Margaret Atwood, Timothy Findley, Alice Munro, Margaret Laurence, Matt Cohen, Robert Weaver, and
Graeme Gibson, to name but a few.

In the spring of 2001, the Marian Engel Archive in Hamilton, Ontario received an exciting and unexpected
new installment of Engel correspondence. Marian Engel: Life in Letters is born of that gift. In making their
selection, Christl Verduyn and Kathleen Garay have chosen correspondence that specifically captures Engel's
life as a writer, a narrative that spans her early youthful travels in Europe to her early death in 1985. In
addition to the letters sent to her friends, this startling and important collection includes letters by Engel to
critics, to editors, to granting officers, to publishers, and a brilliant letter to a chief librarian lambasting him
for, among other pungent criticisms, the library's prejudice against 'Domesticity' amongst other categories.
Thoughtfully presented and accompanied by insightful commentary, these letters are rich in their detail,
filling in the fine points in the life of not only one Canadian writer, but of a nation of writers.
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From reader reviews:

Pierre Taylor:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the subject Marian Engel:
Life in Letters suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular
book untitled Marian Engel: Life in Lettersis a single of several books in which everyone read now. This
book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new
dimension that you ever know before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, consequently all
of people can easily to be aware of the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of information
about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Frank Farrow:

The reserve with title Marian Engel: Life in Letters has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get
a lot of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You can read
the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Harry Fulford:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not seeking Marian Engel: Life in
Letters that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading behavior all
over the world can be said as the way for people to know world better then how they react toward the world.
It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to
be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, it is possible to pick
Marian Engel: Life in Letters become your starter.

Tracy Cluck:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media. You
can choose the very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is
referred to as of book Marian Engel: Life in Letters. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving
behind the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential
that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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