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A valuable horse is dead, and it’s all her fault, which is why 14-year-old Kate McGregor has banished horses
and riding from her life ... forever!

But her new summer job as a companion to Holly Chapman, a former riding star who’s now confined to a
wheelchair, takes her back to the barn—the last place Kate wants to be. 

Can Kate keep her terrible secret from Holly, who is fast becoming her best friend? And, more important,
can she keep her secret from Angela Dean, a teenage bully who lives for only two things: winning ribbons
and causing trouble? 

Kate manages to keep her secret hidden until an accident forces it into the open ... and it's just the moment
Angela has been waiting for.
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Estrella:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Examining a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Keeping Secrets (Timber Ridge Riders
Book 1) book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per-
cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Delores Keener:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you have read is
definitely Keeping Secrets (Timber Ridge Riders Book 1).

Jessica Hurst:

It is possible to spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Keeping Secrets (Timber Ridge
Riders Book 1) is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to
soon. If you did not include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is
make you easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when one buys this book.

Lindsay Washington:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous books that
can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims Keeping Secrets (Timber Ridge Riders
Book 1).
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