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This toolbox provides a series of models to help you develop clear, concise content for virtually any
presentation challenge you'll face. 

It will save you time. It will improve your effectiveness. And it is constructed on the assumption that the best
approach to building any presentation is to develop slides last, not first, in the content development process. 

Most people don’t remember the evolution of visual aids, but PowerPoint was created in 1987 to mimic the
horizontal format of 35-mm slides. At the time, 35-mm slides cost anywhere from thirty-five to seventy-five
dollars each to produce—i.e. to get from designer to audience. 

They were called “speaker support slides” because that’s what they did. They supported the speaker. 

Slideware programs like PowerPoint, Cricket Presents, Keynote, Prezi, SlideRocket, Haiku Deck and Google
Slides were never created as content development tools. When PowerPoint was conceived, people always
finished their content before a single slide was developed. 

Yet most people today would never think of preparing a presentation without spending significant time (and
probably too much time) at a slideware program. 

When slideware is used to develop content, the finished product is often too much information and too many
slides. The speaker now supports the slides, instead of the other way around. 



The result? The next time you’re at a presentation, look around. Is the audience engaged and leaning in to
listen? Or are they disengaged and tuning out to text? 

The Presenter’s Toolbox offers an alternative to developing compelling, effective presentations. With it, you
now have a choice. 

The tools here will help you shape your strategy and develop clear, compelling content. You’ll shift your
resources—your time—from spending hours putting slides together to focusing on audience needs and
strengthening your strategic focus. And, because you’ll probably use fewer slides during your presentations,
you’ll increase the chances of achieving your personal, professional and/or business objectives.

The tools here will help you focus on creating a win for both you and your audience. This is the foundation
on which communication excellence is consistently constructed.

And once you become comfortable using the tools in this box, you'll wonder why you ever developed a
presentation any other way. 
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From reader reviews:

Bryant Kelly:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by
a publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication The Presenter's Toolbox:
Time-saving tools to build better presentations will make you to always be smarter. You can feel
considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that will open or
reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you
seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Jonathan Smith:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this The Presenter's Toolbox: Time-
saving tools to build better presentations book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course
the information in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Leslie White:

The book The Presenter's Toolbox: Time-saving tools to build better presentations will bring you to the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Presenter's Toolbox: Time-
saving tools to build better presentations is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Ann Reiter:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just telling
lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Presenter's Toolbox: Time-saving tools to
build better presentations can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date,
spending your free time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
textbooks have than the others?
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