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**To read the first part of this book for free, get the graphic novel version of "Kellie's Diary #1" (ASIN:
B00C839IPK).**

**Due to reader demand, this is the novel version of Parts 1-3 of the best-selling horror and zombie graphic
novel series "Kellie's Diary," with 3 additional short stories not originally in the graphic novels.**

A series of diary entries through the eyes of a little girl as she tries to survive the end of the world.

This book is entirely from the viewpoint of a little girl writing to her diary. You meet Kellie, a bright and
inquisitive young girl living the typical suburban life with her family; she goes to school, complains about
lunch, and thinks boys are gross. She also writes daily entries into her diary, whom she calls "Barbie."
However, her world is turned upside down when a strange illness takes over the city. During a massive
outbreak, Kellie finds herself completely alone and stranded at school. She must find her way out and figure
out how to get home, braving the dangers of the "monsters" that have taken over... all the while telling
"Barbie" what is going on and what she's thinking.

Follow Kellie's journey as she ventures out into the world, braving dangers of all kinds, both natural and
unnatural, expected and surprising. She must learn to survive based on her own wits, and she will also learn
which instincts she should trust.

A great read for fans of zombie fiction like The Walking Dead.

Reviews (from parts 1-3):

"Surrealistic and haunting, this story gets under the skin like a virulent infection... Jenner's slightly twisted
yet subtle narrative as seen through Kellie's innocent eyes is compelling..." - George Wier, Mystery Author

"Be prepared... it is quite sad seeing all the death and destruction through a child's eyes, but I'm telling you it
is worth it in the end." - Blood, Sweat & Books

"The simple style this story is presented in sometimes tricks you into taking it at face value; but it's the
reading between the lines that gives you the full sense of horror in the world around the main character." -
Amazon Reviewer "zombie"
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Haller:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due
to the fact just their can do that. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Kellie's Diary: Decay of
Innocence to read.

Michael Kimbrell:

The ability that you get from Kellie's Diary: Decay of Innocence will be the more deep you rooting the
information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is
hard to recognise but Kellie's Diary: Decay of Innocence giving you joy feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the
author of this e-book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase
well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We suggest you for having this particular Kellie's Diary: Decay of Innocence instantly.

Mae Bushee:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you is Kellie's Diary: Decay of Innocence this publication consist a lot of the information
on the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how can the world has grown up.
The words styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some research
when he makes this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Rosa Rodriguez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
also know that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by
book. Different categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this Kellie's Diary:
Decay of Innocence.
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