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Increasing media scrutiny, global coverage and communication via the internet means corporate reputation
can be damaged quickly, and failing to successfully address challenges to corporate reputation has
consequences. Companies generally suffer almost ten times the financial loss from damaged reputations than
from whatever fines may be imposed. According to Ernst & Young, the investment community believes up
to 50 per cent of a company's value is intangible - based mostly on corporate reputation. So recognizing
potential threats, or anticipating risks, emerges as a critical organizational competence. Organizations can
regain lost reputations, but recovery takes a long time.

Corporate Reputation contains both academic content along with practical contributions, developed by those
serving as consultants or working in organizations in the area of corporate reputation and its management or
recovery. It covers: why corporate reputation matters, the increase in reputation loss, threats to corporate
reputation, monitoring reputation threats online and offline, the key role of leadership in reputation recovery,
and making corporate reputation immune from threats.

Any book that is going to do justice to a subject that is so complex and intangible needs imagination, depth
and range, and this is exactly what the contributors bring with them.
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From reader reviews:

Jacob Gray:

In other case, little persons like to read book Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities and Threats
(Psychological and Behavioural Aspects of Risk). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important a new book Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities and
Threats (Psychological and Behavioural Aspects of Risk). You can add know-how and of course you can
around the world by the book. Absolutely right, since from book you can learn everything! From your
country until eventually foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you
may know that. In this era, you can open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book.
You should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Tracy Rendon:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities
and Threats (Psychological and Behavioural Aspects of Risk) as your daily resource information.

John Parish:

This book untitled Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities and Threats (Psychological and
Behavioural Aspects of Risk) to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that's because when
you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you
can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read
this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past
this e-book from your list.

Kenneth Garrison:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those publications
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. From the book
Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities and Threats (Psychological and Behavioural Aspects of
Risk) we can get more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must love to read a
book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by
this book Corporate Reputation: Managing Opportunities and Threats (Psychological and Behavioural
Aspects of Risk). You can more attractive than now.
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