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Small though they were, PT boats played a key role in World War II, carrying out an astonishing variety of
missions where fast, versatile, and strongly armed vessels were needed. Called "weapons of opportunity,"
they met the enemy at closer quarters and with greater frequency than any other type of surface craft. Among
the most famous PT commanders was John F. Kennedy, whose courageous actions in the Pacific are now
well known to the American public. The author of the book, another distinguished PT boat commander in the
Pacific, compiled this history of PT-boat operations in World War II for the U.S. Navy shortly after V-J Day,
when memories were fresh and records easily assessable. Bulkley provides a wealth of facts about these
motor torpedo boats, whose vast range of operation covered two oceans as well as the Mediterranean and the
English Channel. Although their primary mission was to attack surface ships and craft close to shore, they
were also used effectively to lay mines and smoke screens, to rescue downed aviators, and to carry out
intelligence and raider operations. The author gives special attention to the crews, paying well-deserved
tribute to their heroism, skill, and sacrifice that helped to win the war.
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From reader reviews:

Brandi Cardoza:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy book is
readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer
regarding At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy content conveys prospect easily to
understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different as it.
So , do you nevertheless thinking At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy is not loveable to
be your top record reading book?

Mable Watkins:

The book untitled At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy contain a lot of information on this.
The writer explains her idea with easy approach. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so
do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author
brings you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read more your
smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.

Dorothy Payne:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in
the top list in your reading list is At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy. This book which
can be qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking way
up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Elizabeth Maez:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we
know those books have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to
around the world. From the book At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy we can acquire
more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a
book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life by
this book At Close Quarters: PT Boats in the United States Navy. You can more appealing than now.
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