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Jessica is just a small-town girl, waiting tables at a fast-paced restaurant in Manhattan. Like most newcomers
to New York City, she dreams of making it big. Her plan: meet a wealthy bachelor and fall in love with him.
What could be easier?

But when an attractive co-worker named Jasper becomes involved in her plan, things begin to get
complicated. Jasper’s supposed to help Jess find her wealthy suitor, but his good looks and charm become
hard for Jess to resist.

Can Jessica accomplish her plan with the help of Jasper, or is Jasper just getting in the way?

This wealthy romance unfolds over multiple volumes, and contains adult situations and explicit content.
Mature audiences only.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Rinehart:

This Expensive Taste (Business of Love Book 1) are usually reliable for you who want to be considered a
successful person, why. The reason of this Expensive Taste (Business of Love Book 1) can be on the list of
great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food but feed anyone with
information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it
everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this Expensive Taste
(Business of Love Book 1) forcing you to have an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving
you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in
reading.

Debra Ruff:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Expensive Taste (Business of Love
Book 1) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice
all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react in
the direction of the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual
but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your
good habit, it is possible to pick Expensive Taste (Business of Love Book 1) become your own starter.

Tracy Rendon:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon.
The Expensive Taste (Business of Love Book 1) provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Eugene Meunier:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television programs
or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Expensive Taste (Business of Love Book
1) can be the response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than
the others?
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