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A classic in art therapy literature since its introduction nearly two decades ago, this book is an expression of
the author's desire to link the practice of art psychotherapy to the core issues of life as presented in
existentialism. The inclusion of existential in this book's title denotes an interest in human struggle with
issues of life in the face of death. The Canvas Mirror is the story of connections the author's connections with
his patients, their connections with each other, and, ultimately, the author's connections with the reader. We
are provided in this book with a philosophy of how to be rather than a manual of what to do. The author
shows us that it is possible to speak in plain language about the difficulties of therapists' patients if art
therapists also speak to themselves in that same language. Unique features include: existential values and
artistic traditions; metaphor, ritual, and journey; structuring chaos; existential emptiness and art; tenets of
existential art therapy; the frame of The Canvas Mirror; listening to images and relating to artworks;
dimensions of creative action; artists of the cutting edge; the changing face of illness; existential leadership
and basic tasks; and dialoguing with dreams. Replete with numerous illustrations, this text will serve as a
valuable resource to medical and mental health professionals, occupational therapists, artists, students and
theorists of art, and rehabilitation professionals. The current state of mental health care, with short stays and
a problem-focused approach, makes this book even more relevant today than when it was first published in
1990.
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Wyss:

Here thing why this kind of Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror are different and trusted to be yours.
First of all studying a book is good but it depends in the content from it which is the content is as yummy as
food or not. Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror giving you information deeper since different ways,
you can find any reserve out there but there is no e-book that similar with Existential Art Therapy: The
Canvas Mirror. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing which
happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
park, café, or even in your method home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the
imprinted book maybe the form of Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror in e-book can be your option.

Eileen Williams:

The publication untitled Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror is the book that recommended to you to
read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to anyone. The language that writer
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the
book, therefore the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also can get
the e-book of Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror from the publisher to make you far more enjoy
free time.

Jose Gower:

The book with title Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror contains a lot of information that you can
discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new information the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you within new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Marla Fiske:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of book
Existential Art Therapy: The Canvas Mirror. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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