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May It Please the Court presents the story of one man's rise from a struggling sole practitioner to the senior
partner of the largest suburban law firm in the United States. Although this book is an autobiography of
attorney Leonard Rivkin, it is much more. Because of its wealth of information and insights into the life of
an attorney, the book could have been titled:

So You Want to Be a Lawyer? - since it goes into the real life practice of law as well as the pragmatic ups
and downs of a law practice; or

What Law Schools Don't Teach You - since it covers "getting" new clients, how to hold clients, the general
marketing of a law office, solid tips on how to run a law office, and many other practical aspects that are
rarely, if ever, covered in law school; or even

Lawyers Behind Closed Doors - since it shows how legal strategies evolved in some of the most well-know
cases of our generation. The reader goes behind the scenes into the conference room as well as the courtroom
and get a look at defense tactics utilized in cases such as Agent Orange (then the largest mass tort case of its
time); Franklin Nation Bank (then the country's largest bank failure); Asbestos, and many others. May It
Please the Court is a great antidote to current media perceptions of lawyers (Ally McBeal, etc.) and a real-
life balance to popular novelists such as John Grisham and Scott Thurow. Every young or would-be lawyer
will benefit from reading this book, as will practicing attorneys. And with our society's fascination with legal
matters, general audiences will find this a readable, engaging look at the legal world.
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From reader reviews:

Tracie Wright:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its include may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that
fantastic as in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer may be May It Please the Court! From Auto
Accidents to Agent Orange: Building a Storefront Law Practice into America's Largest Suburban Law Firm
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.

Ginger Amundson:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need more
time to be learn. May It Please the Court! From Auto Accidents to Agent Orange: Building a Storefront Law
Practice into America's Largest Suburban Law Firm can be your answer because it can be read by you who
have those short free time problems.

Beth Murray:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The May It Please
the Court! From Auto Accidents to Agent Orange: Building a Storefront Law Practice into America's Largest
Suburban Law Firm provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Minnie Rivera:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book May It Please the Court! From Auto
Accidents to Agent Orange: Building a Storefront Law Practice into America's Largest Suburban Law Firm
to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you
such as reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and
examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and read it. Beside that the e-
book May It Please the Court! From Auto Accidents to Agent Orange: Building a Storefront Law Practice



into America's Largest Suburban Law Firm can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone
and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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