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Born shortly after the invention of the printing press, Luther became one of Europe’s best selling authors,
along with others like Erasmus, and his theology was mass produced across Europe. He strongly disputed the
claim that freedom from God's punishment of sin could be purchased with money, known as indulgences,
and he confronted indulgence salesman Johann Tetzel with his Ninety-Five Theses in 1517, one of the most
important religious writings of all time. His refusal to retract all of his writings at the demand of Pope Leo X
in 1520 and the Holy Roman Emperor Charles V at the Diet of Worms in 1521 resulted in his
excommunication by the Pope and condemnation as an outlaw by the emperor.
Luther, of course, did not back down. Although the story about him nailing 95 Theses to a church door is
almost surely apocryphal, Luther continued that salvation is not earned by good deeds but received only as a
free gift of God's grace through faith in Jesus Christ as redeemer from sin. His theology also continued to
directly challenge the Pope’s authority by teaching that the Bible is the only source of divinely revealed
knowledge.
John Calvin (1509-1564) was one of the most important religious figures of the last millennium and an
instantly recognizable name across the globe. Calvin was an influential French theologian and pastor during
the Protestant Reformation, and the period when he was most active, the 1530s and 1540s, was marked by
increased complexity and the diffusion of the Reformation into several branches. Alongside Martin Luther,
Calvin was one of the central Reformers, and after fleeing to Basel, Switzerland, he published the Institutes
of the Christian Religion in 1536.
Calvin was a tireless and controversial worker who corresponded with other leading reformers of the day, but
he was also a deeply theological man who published his own interpretations and teachings on Scripture.
Today, he is chiefly remembered for the religious proponents that bear his name as Calvinists, and their
steadfast devotion to the doctrine of predestination and the absolute sovereignty of God in salvation of the
human soul from death and eternal damnation.
Like anybody whose life was so influential, Calvin and Luther have both been the subject of many myths and
legends, all of which have come to obscure the actual historical figures, even while they maximize the
importance of their accomplishments. Martin Luther and John Calvin provides an objective and
comprehensive overview of both men's lives and legacies.
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From reader reviews:

James Marcotte:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Martin Luther and John Calvin: Leaders of the Protestant
Reformation. Try to make book Martin Luther and John Calvin: Leaders of the Protestant Reformation as
your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with
this book.

Galen Dent:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Martin Luther and John Calvin: Leaders of
the Protestant Reformation. All type of book can you see on many options. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Donna Young:

The book untitled Martin Luther and John Calvin: Leaders of the Protestant Reformation is the e-book that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to a
person. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was
did a lot of investigation when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Martin Luther and John Calvin: Leaders of the Protestant
Reformation from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Gary Copeland:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine
you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Martin Luther and John
Calvin: Leaders of the Protestant Reformation which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's see.
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