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1833, Catherine Jane Hamilton returned from India to Edinburgh to seek a divorce from her husband, the
physician Alexander Lesassier. The charge was adultery, and proof for it lay in a trunk containing her
husband's personal papers. Catherine won her suit without difficulty and the trunk was deposited in the
library of the Royal College of Physicians of Edinburgh. Alexander Lesassier died in 1839 during the First
Afghan War; his trunk and its contents remained untouched for the next century and a half.

It has now been opened and a remarkable tale, told in remarkable detail, has spilled forth. The life of
Alexander Lesassier, as expertly reconstructed by Lisa Rosner, affords startling insight into the sensibilities
of an era and of the man who, in his own eyes and those of the women who adored him, was its most perfect
creation.

Affable and self-absorbed, engaging and ignoble Lesassier was a physician, military surgeon, and novelist,
who was also a shameless opportunist, charming scoundrel, seducer, and survivor. His is the story of a failed
medical man who wanted to be something different and saw himself as entitled to more than he had;
someone who can always be guaranteed to make the wrong choice, and then protest that he has done well.

This fascinating and deeply absorbing book offers rare insights into Georgian, Regency, and early Victorian
Britain through the fortunes and misfortunes, hopes and whims, of "the most beautiful man in existence."
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From reader reviews:

Robert Ford:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting The Most Beautiful Man
in Existence: The Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for
people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly
that reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to become success
person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you could pick The Most
Beautiful Man in Existence: The Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier become your current starter.

Charlene Martinez:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this The Most Beautiful Man in Existence: The
Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to
make book that could be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still skepticism The Most
Beautiful Man in Existence: The Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier as good book not simply by the
cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you
still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already
said so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Stanley Torres:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know
that little person including reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your current teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Many kinds
of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually The Most Beautiful Man in
Existence: The Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier.

Carmelita Ratliff:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book The Most Beautiful Man in Existence: The
Scandalous Life of Alexander Lesassier to make your own reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading
proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study
it and mingle the feeling about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide
open a book and read it. Beside that the book The Most Beautiful Man in Existence: The Scandalous Life of



Alexander Lesassier can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in what must
you're doing of these time.
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