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"Logo R.I.P. works both as a critique of corporate culture and design's complicity in it and a celebration of
some of the past century's most resonant graphic symbols. . . . It may be clever enough to appeal to anti-
corporate activist and corporate climber alike."—EYE Magazine

"Logo R.I.P. is not just a nostalgia trip, but a serious questioning of the ephemerality of modern life."—The
Sunday Times

"Behind every good logo is a hidden history of the rise and fall. . . . Logo R.I.P. is a compact, well-illustrated
study."—NRC Handelsblad

Including a foreword by Gert Dumbar and featuring design classics NASA, British Steel, BOAC, and Pan
Am, Logo R.I.P. is a commemoration of defunct logos that were once an integral part of the landscape, our
visual culture, and our lives. Many are icons of their time or can be deemed design classics. In this updated
edition, several iconic trademarks (AT&T, Kodak, Lucent, Rover, and Xerox) are added to the logo
graveyard. Each entry includes a short obituary (design and cultural history) to ensure that, although these
logos may be gone, they are not forgotten.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Gorski:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as
in the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer can be Logo R.I.P.: A Commemoration of Dead Logotypes
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you.
The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
guide you to pick up this book.

Carl Adams:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
read a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, along with soon.
The Logo R.I.P.: A Commemoration of Dead Logotypes provide you with a new experience in examining a
book.

Sandra Leggett:

This Logo R.I.P.: A Commemoration of Dead Logotypes is brand new way for you who has fascination to
look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more
you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Logo R.I.P.: A
Commemoration of Dead Logotypes can be the light food for you personally because the information inside
this kind of book is easy to get through anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable
by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel drowsy
even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your
better life in addition to knowledge.

Sheila Whitley:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This reserve Logo R.I.P.: A Commemoration of Dead Logotypes was filled in relation to
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can experience
enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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