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Your Office  is the Office Applications textbook written for instructors who want more than a ‘skill & drill’
book that enables students to learn discreet tasks but fails to illustrate the big picture of how these skills work
together.   Your Office  bridges the gap between skill and application, and empowers students to master
Office 2010 as a tool to solve problems and make decisions.
 
The cases progress students from learning the skills in each Office Application to using the applications as
tools to make business decisions.
 
The unique modular structure provides a strong foundation for students through practice in each workshop
and then synthesizes the objectives covered over two workshops, challenging students to really retain what
they learned as opposed to learning and then forgetting soon after.
 
The series scenario introduces a large global business (the resort and spa) made up of smaller businesses
(golf pro shop, spa, restaurants, event planning, etc) featured in the cases that run throughout all four
applications.  This approach gives students a solid understanding of how an organization works by exposing
them to how individuals in all facets of a business interact with tools like Microsoft Office and use
information to make decisions.
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From reader reviews:

George Marsh:

This book untitled Your Office: Microsoft Office 2010, Volume 1 to be one of several books that best seller
in this year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
that book in the book store or you can order it through online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no
reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Joanne Hall:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Your Office: Microsoft Office 2010,
Volume 1 book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be understand by
anyone who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and writing
skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Your Office: Microsoft Office 2010,
Volume 1 as good book not merely by the cover but also from the content. This is one reserve that can break
don't ascertain book by its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh
come on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Sheila Davis:

This Your Office: Microsoft Office 2010, Volume 1 is great reserve for you because the content that is full
of information for you who also always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it facts accurately using great organize word or we can declare no rambling sentences in it. So if you
are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward
sentences but tricky core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Your Office: Microsoft
Office 2010, Volume 1 in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We
can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten or fifteen tiny right but this guide already do that. So ,
this really is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?

Casey Reeves:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Your Office: Microsoft Office 2010,
Volume 1 can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books
have than the others?
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