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Most single women have experienced the sinking feeling of fishing for a date from someone special without
receiving so much as a nibble. It is enough to make women wonder if there is something wrong with their
bait.

Steve Nakamoto, a former Dale Carnegie instructor, personal development trainer, and professional tour
director understands these feelings. He has written an intelligent, funny, and wise book for women who are
looking to catch a guy---hook, line, and sinker. In this entertaining look at relationships, he compares men to
fish who are secretly longing to be caught. Women, on the other hand, are wily yet compassionate anglers
looking to reel in the big one.

Men Are Like Fish will take readers on a fact-packed fishing trip where they will learn tips on how to initiate
great relationships or enhance the ones they already have. The book is sweetly old-fashioned, yet wickedly
on target. Nakamoto has also sprinkled zippy cartoons/illustrations and unusually helpful quotes throughout
the book.

While the title might imply a single-minded effort to drag an unsuspecting man into the net, the book is
actually somewhat Zenlike. It will help women to improve their self-images, broaden their interests, and
accentuate the unique qualities they possess that will naturally draw good relationships to them. Nakamoto
also spends a good deal of time discussing the end of relationships. He shows women how to let go
gracefully, with as little pain as possible, so that they can continue to grow without harboring bitterness. He
uses several examples from his own life, sharing many of his triumphs and failures with a good-natured
sense of humor.

Nakamoto shares one especially funny story about a tight jeans contest where he lost a shapely
girlfriend/contestant to judge Clint Eastwood. He writes, I consoled myself with the thought that Deanna
must have had a tough choice: Clint Eastwood (People Weekly s 2001 #2 most popular screen actor of all
time) or Steve Nakamoto? It could have gone either way, right?

Nakamoto also shares good, solid advice. One especially helpful area is Favorite Fishing Holes: 101 Hot
Spots Where the Big Ones Are Biting. It consists of a list of fun and inexpensive activities and places to
explore that are bound to be interesting, even if they do not spark a new love affair. Among the many
activities that Nakamoto recommends are going to art gallery openings, visiting wineries for wine tasting and
tours, and taking city tours or day trips in one s own city or in a nearby town.

Nakamoto does not guarantee eternal love for readers. However, both single women looking for that perfect
catch and those seeking to recapture the romance of an exciting relationship will find great value here. Men
Are Like Fish is guaranteed to give even the most jaded and discouraged romantic angler a new, more joyful
perspective on the oldest sport in the world. --- Reviewed by Kathleen Youman
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Ostby:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Men Are Like Fish: What
Every Woman Needs to Know About Catching a Man will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel
more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think which open or reading the book
make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or
suited book with you?

Mary Salas:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This Men Are Like Fish: What Every Woman Needs to Know About
Catching a Man book is readable simply by you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that
want to offer to you. The writer regarding Men Are Like Fish: What Every Woman Needs to Know About
Catching a Man content conveys objective easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the information but it just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Men Are Like
Fish: What Every Woman Needs to Know About Catching a Man is not loveable to be your top record
reading book?

Vincent Mireles:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Men Are Like Fish: What Every Woman Needs to Know
About Catching a Man as the daily resource information.

Sylvia Ferland:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
also know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Men
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