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How is a human like a deep-sea mollusk? How is a computer like the desert wind? Surprising connections
between the natural world, human culture, and digital technology are discovered here in the metaphorical
philosophy of Vilém Flusser (1920-1991). Although Flusser champions human artistic creativity as the only
way to make an absurd world meaningful, his metaphors conceal in plain view the oppposite suspicion:
Nature's chaos will always have the upper hand. This study explores Flusser's writings to propose how
human beings can use the principles of digital technology to create whole alternative worlds by artistically
designing spaces for nature's random chance. What emerges then will always be unpredictable, be it in the
form of software, poetry, or genetic art. This book is a treat for artists, scientists, cultural and media theorists,
and Flusser scholars alike.
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From reader reviews:

Randell Easley:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Of Pixels and Particles: The digital connection between
nature and art in Vilém Flusser's philosophy. Try to make book Of Pixels and Particles: The digital
connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's philosophy as your pal. It means that it can to become
your friend when you experience alone and beside that of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very
fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know anything by
the book. So , let's make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Noah Gardner:

The book Of Pixels and Particles: The digital connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's
philosophy can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we
leave a good thing like a book Of Pixels and Particles: The digital connection between nature and art in
Vilém Flusser's philosophy? Several of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this
book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these.
Book Of Pixels and Particles: The digital connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's philosophy
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous
world by available and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

James Mace:

Often the book Of Pixels and Particles: The digital connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's
philosophy will bring one to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is
very unique. In the event you try to find new book to see, this book very suitable to you. The book Of Pixels
and Particles: The digital connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's philosophy is much
recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can
quickly to read the book.

Alice Billups:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story as well as
their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children, there are
many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their ability in writing,



they also doing some analysis before they write with their book. One of them is this Of Pixels and Particles:
The digital connection between nature and art in Vilém Flusser's philosophy.
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