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Fully revised and updated, the second edition of Introduction to Global Politics places an increased emphasis
on the themes of continuity and change. It continues to explain global politics using an historical approach,
firmly linking history with the events of today. By integrating theory and political practice at individual,
state, and global levels, students are introduced to key developments in global politics, helping them make
sense of major trends that are shaping our world.

This is a highly illustrated textbook with informative and interactive boxed material throughout. Chapter
opening timelines contextualise the material that follows, and definitions of key terms are provided in a
glossary at the end of the book. Every chapter ends with student activities, cultural materials, and annotated
suggestions for further reading that now include websites.

Key updates for this edition:

New chapter on 'The causes of war and the changing nature of violence in global politics'❍

New chapter on 'Technology and global politics'❍

Enhanced coverage of theory including post-positivist theories❍

Uses ‘levels of analysis’ framework throughout the text❍

New material on the financial crisis, BRIC and Iran❍

Introduction to Global Politics continues to be essential reading for students of political science, global
politics and international relations.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Pinkerton:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Introduction to Global Politics. You can choose the best
book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Introduction to Global
Politics. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right,
simply because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may
be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up to go to the library.
Let's go through.

Marjorie Cook:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot more to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Introduction to Global Politics book
because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred pct
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Mary Hubbard:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled
Introduction to Global Politics your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect
that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written
in a guide then become one type conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get ahead of. The
Introduction to Global Politics giving you another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also
giving you useful info for your better life on this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern is your
body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a. Do you want to try
this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Harriet Dupree:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or
just searching for the Introduction to Global Politics when you desired it?
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