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Now in paperback, internationally bestselling author Indu Sundaresan presents a poignant collection
of contemporary short stories about the challenges and consequences faced by women in Indian life
today.

Like Jhumpa Lahiri’s Interpreter of Maladies, Indu Sundaresan’s In the Convent of Little Flowers gives
readers an eloquent and illuminating collection of stories about contemporary Indian life, exploring the
cutting-edge issues that surround the clash between ancient tradition and modernity. In the collection’s title
story, a young woman adopted by an American family in Seattle receives a letter from Sister Mary Theresa,
a nun at the Convent of Little Flowers in Chennai, where she stayed as a child. Unbeknownst to the Indian
woman, the nun is her biological mother’s sister. In another story, the grandmother of an Indian journalist
begs her grandson to intervene and stop a young widow from being burned alive. And when a teenaged
daughter bears a child out of wedlock, her entire family is thrown into turmoil. With their lush prose, vividly
rendered settings, and complex characters, these and the other stories in this elegant collection bring readers
into the experience of Indian women at home and abroad, where modernity offers them lives their
grandmothers could never dream of, while at the same time taking away parts of their history. With a
delicate touch, Indu Sundaresan weaves the pieces of the conflict together, presenting a nuanced and
unforgettable tapestry.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Clarke:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will want this In the Convent of Little Flowers: Stories.

Randy Hunter:

The book In the Convent of Little Flowers: Stories make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to
make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting strain or having
big problem together with your subject. If you can make looking at a book In the Convent of Little Flowers:
Stories to become your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your
knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open and read a reserve In the
Convent of Little Flowers: Stories. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or
other individuals. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Larry Gregg:

The guide untitled In the Convent of Little Flowers: Stories is the e-book that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to an individual. The language that
article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot
of investigation when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You
also could get the e-book of In the Convent of Little Flowers: Stories from the publisher to make you a lot
more enjoy free time.

William Rockwood:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and In the Convent of Little Flowers:
Stories as well as others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel
want to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to put their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any other book likes
In the Convent of Little Flowers: Stories to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book
like this.
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