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The brilliant new novel in the New York Times bestselling series by Louise Penny, one of the most acclaimed
crime writers of our time

No outsiders are ever admitted to the monastery of Saint-Gilbert-Entre-les-Loups, hidden deep in the
wilderness of Quebec, where two dozen cloistered monks live in peace and prayer. They grow vegetables,
they tend chickens, they make chocolate. And they sing. Ironically, for a community that has taken a vow of
silence, the monks have become world-famous for their glorious voices, raised in ancient chants whose effect
on both singer and listener is so profound it is known as "the beautiful mystery."

But when the renowned choir director is murdered, the lock on the monastery's massive wooden door is
drawn back to admit Chief Inspector Armand Gamache and Jean-Guy Beauvoir of the Sûreté du Québec.
There they discover disquiet beneath the silence, discord in the apparent harmony. One of the brothers, in
this life of prayer and contemplation, has been contemplating murder. As the peace of the monastery
crumbles, Gamache is forced to confront some of his own demons, as well as those roaming the remote
corridors. Before finding the killer, before restoring peace, the Chief must first consider the divine, the
human, and the cracks in between.

The Beautiful Mystery is the winner of the 2012 Agatha Award for best novel, the 2013 Anthony Award for
best novel and the 2013 Macavity Award for best novel.
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From reader reviews:

Gwen Dawes:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled The Beautiful Mystery: A Chief Inspector Gamache Novel (A Chief
Inspector Gamache Mystery Book 8). Try to stumble through book The Beautiful Mystery: A Chief
Inspector Gamache Novel (A Chief Inspector Gamache Mystery Book 8) as your buddy. It means that it can
being your friend when you feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah,
it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little
thing by the book. So , let us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Eli Gaddy:

The particular book The Beautiful Mystery: A Chief Inspector Gamache Novel (A Chief Inspector Gamache
Mystery Book 8) has a lot details on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book
was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes some research prior to write this book. This
book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this article book.

Alberto Alvarez:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its handle may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer can be The Beautiful Mystery: A Chief Inspector Gamache Novel (A Chief
Inspector Gamache Mystery Book 8) why because the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the
content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or even cover.
Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Mamie Donnelly:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every
year seemed to be exactly added. This publication The Beautiful Mystery: A Chief Inspector Gamache Novel
(A Chief Inspector Gamache Mystery Book 8) was filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add
your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading
the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern
era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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