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The instability of fluid flows is a key topic in classical fluid mechanics because it has huge repercussions for
applied disciplines such as chemical engineering, hydraulics, aeronautics, and geophysics. This modern
introduction is written for any student, researcher, or practitioner working in the area, for whom an
understanding of hydrodynamic instabilities is essential. Based on a decade's experience of teaching
postgraduate students in fluid dynamics, this book brings the subject to life by emphasizing the physical
mechanisms involved. The theory of dynamical systems provides the basic structure of the exposition,
together with asymptotic methods. Wherever possible, Charru discusses the phenomena in terms of
characteristic scales and dimensional analysis. The book includes numerous experimental studies, with
references to videos and multimedia material, as well as over 150 exercises which introduce the reader to
new problems.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Pillar:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the
information inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Hydrodynamic
Instabilities (Cambridge Texts in Applied Mathematics) is kind of book which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Cora Spillane:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Hydrodynamic Instabilities (Cambridge
Texts in Applied Mathematics) reserve written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written with good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still hesitation
Hydrodynamic Instabilities (Cambridge Texts in Applied Mathematics) as good book not just by the cover
but also with the content. This is one guide that can break don't judge book by its deal with, so do you still
needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already
said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Jordan Moore:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Hydrodynamic Instabilities (Cambridge Texts
in Applied Mathematics) can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of
date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Camille Wolfe:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or
make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Hydrodynamic Instabilities (Cambridge Texts in Applied
Mathematics) can make you experience more interested to read.
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