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"I am very pleased to see EPPP Fundamentals, a concise, compact presentation of essential information,
that does not overwhelm the reader who is already feeling some anxiety about the upcoming exam. This is an
effi cient alternative to expensive EPPP preparation courses, and is now at the top of my list of
recommendations for our graduates."

Richard Tedeschi, PhD, Professor of Psychology, University of North Carolina-Charlotte

This authoritative guide to the EPPP provides an affordable, concise, and comprehensive review of core
exam content and includes over 300 sample questions. The guide goes beyond merely "teaching the test"
through rote memorization. Instead, it covers the eight content domains of the EPPP and their knowledge
areas in a step-by-step, narrative, and review format. The book also includes contributions from the directors
of top psychology training and internship programs in the United States. The combined approach of
providing a comprehensive review from true content experts helps users gain the depth and breadth of
knowledge required for passing the exam, and mirrors how doctoral-level courses are commonly taught.

The review gives test-takers an orientation to the EPPP by covering the development and format of the exam
along with successful test-taking strategies. Chapters covering EPPP content domains each include a
comprehensive review of the material, key points to remember, sample questions and answers, and
recommended readings for more in-depth study. Reflecting the test's presentation, chapter authors cover each
subject domain according to the ASPPB's EPPP Information for Candidates Guide. Chapters are written by
clinical supervisors and faculty directly involved in training interns, residents, and fellows in psychology. In
addition to sample exam questions with answers in each chapter, a bonus section of 100 questions gives
readers practice in taking this high-stakes test.

Key Features:

Presents an in-depth, comprehensive content review that goes beyond "teaching the test"●

Provides an affordable alternative to expensive EPPP preparation courses●

Written and edited by directors of the foremost training, internship, and postdoctoral fellowship programs●

Includes key points to remember, sample questions and answers, and recommended readings in each●

chapter
Presents over 300 sample questions and answers●
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From reader reviews:

Rita Campanelli:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even an issue. What people must be
consider if those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now could be
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you have it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for
you. All those possibilities will not happen within you if you take EPPP Fundamentals: Review for the
Examination for Professional Practice in Psychology as your daily resource information.

Keri Yokum:

This book untitled EPPP Fundamentals: Review for the Examination for Professional Practice in Psychology
to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this guide you can
get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it
by means of online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book,
as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this book from
your list.

Angela Thomas:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving EPPP Fundamentals: Review for the
Examination for Professional Practice in Psychology that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by
reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world
considerably better then how they react to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading behavior only
for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every
you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick EPPP Fundamentals: Review for the
Examination for Professional Practice in Psychology become your starter.

Shawn Mathison:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This e-book EPPP Fundamentals: Review for the Examination for Professional
Practice in Psychology was filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
scientific research competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading any book. If you know how
big selling point of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this point,
many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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