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'Sir, God hath taken away your eldest son by a cannon shot. It brake his leg. We were necessitated to have it
cut off, whereof he died.' In one of the most famous and moving letters of the Civil War, Oliver Cromwell
told his brother-in-law that on 2 July 1644 Parliament had won an emphatic victory over a Royalist army
commanded by King Charles I's nephew, Prince Rupert, on rolling moorland west of York. But that battle,
Marston Moor, had also slain his own nephew, the recipient's firstborn. In this vividly narrated history of the
deadly conflict that engulfed the nation during the 1640s, Peter Gaunt shows that, with the exception of
World War I, the death-rate was higher than any other contest in which Britain has participated. Numerous
towns and villages were garrisoned, attacked, damaged or wrecked. The landscape was profoundly altered.
Yet amidst all the blood and killing, the fighting was also a catalyst for profound social change and
innovation. Charting major battles, raids and engagements, the author uses rich contemporary accounts to
explore the life-changing experience of war for those involved, whether musketeers at Cheriton, dragoons at
Edgehill or Cromwell's disciplined Ironsides at Naseby (1645).
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Santiago:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible The
English Civil War: A Military History? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can
spend your time with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Dewayne Campbell:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write
about the data about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this The
English Civil War: A Military History.

Jenna Springer:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day long to
reading a reserve. The book The English Civil War: A Military History it is rather good to read. There are a
lot of those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not
have enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
out of your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book features high quality.

Jessica Bowman:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be The English Civil War: A Military History why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you
to pick up this book.
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