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The artist's first solo exhibition in a New York museum since 1980, James Turrell considers his long-
standing explorations of perception, light, color and space with special attention to the role of site-specificity
in his practice. Local audiences find new occasion to experience his work through a major new project
created especially for the Guggenheim, Aten Reign (2013), recasting the museum's rotunda as a volume of
shifting natural and artificial light. One of the most dramatic transformations of the museum ever conceived,
the installation reimagines Frank Lloyd Wright's iconic architecture--its openness to nature, its graceful
curves, its magnificent sense of space and light--as one of Turrell's Skyspaces. Experienced for the first time
only from below, the rotunda appears not as an open void but as a mass of vibrant color that expands and
contracts above the heads of visitors, and at the installation's core, daylight from the museum's oculus
connects the work to the outside environment. Through these interventions, Turrell rekindles the museum's
identity as a "temple of spirit" (to quote the museum's first director, Hilla Rebay), encouraging a state of
meditative contemplation. This full-color catalogue accompanies the exhibition at the Guggenheim, detailing
the production of the rotunda installation and situating it in the context of Turrell's career. In addition to
beautifully reproduced images featuring the artist's early works, his magnum opus Roden Crater Project
(1979- ), and documentation of Aten Reign, this volume includes essays by the show's curators, Stephen and
Nan Swid Curator of Twentieth-Century Art, Carmen Giménez, and Associate Curator Nat Trotman, and
Arthur Zajonc, Emeritus Professor of Physics at Amherst College.
As an undergraduate, James Turrell (born 1943) studied psychology and mathematics, transitioning to art at
MFA level. A practicing Quaker, one of his earliest memories is of his grandmother inviting him to "go
inside and greet the light" at Quaker meetings. The recipient of several prestigious awards such as
Guggenheim and MacArthur Fellowships, Turrell lives in Arizona.
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From reader reviews:

David Tillery:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept James Turrell
suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. Often the book untitled
James Turrellis one of several books that everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people
in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know
just before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the
core of this publication. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. So you
can see the represented of the world within this book.

Robert Aviles:

The reserve with title James Turrell posesses a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of
help after read this book. This book exist new expertise the information that exist in this book represented the
condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world.
This kind of book will bring you with new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book with your
smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Kelly Cruz:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like James Turrell which is
getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.

Harold Morris:

A lot of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book James Turrell to make your personal reading is
interesting. Your current skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the impression about book and studying
especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open a book and learn it. Beside that the reserve
James Turrell can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what must
you're doing of that time.
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